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Апартамент в Altos de los Monteros Референция: R3630860

Спальни: 2 Ванные: 2 M²: 90

Цена: 0 €
Аренда: 0 € / Месяц
Короткая аренда:
от 550 до 1 400 € / Неделя

Статус: Аренда,
Туристические

Тип недвижимости:
Апартамент

Места: по запросу
День печати : 6th Июль
2024

Описание:Welcome to Samara, our modern holiday home in the mountains of Los Altos de los Monteros, only 10
minutes from Marbella center away. Samara is a luxury resort with 24 hours concierge and fully secured. It has
everything you need for relaxing holidays, community pool, sauna, heated indoor pool, massage room, and a gym. 
The living area of the holiday apartment is distributed all on one floor and has only 4 steps from the garage, where
the parking space is located. The apartment with spectacular sea views from all the rooms, consist of 2 bedrooms,
2 bathrooms, an open fully equipped kitchen, and a spacious living and dining room with access to the beautiful
large covered terrace with amazing sea views. The main bedroom with an en-suite bathroom has a double bed and
spectacular views to the sea, the windows have blackout curtains to ensure your rest. Furthermore, the main
bedroom benefits from a lot of closet space. We also provide towels, bed linen and beach towels so you only need
to bring your personal items for your holiday in Samara. The apartment consists of AC hot/cold in all the rooms, so
you can adapt the temperature to your needs. The en-suite bathroom of the main bedroom has a large bathtub and
a walk-in shower, a double sink, toilet, and a bidet. Also, there is available a hairdryer in both bathrooms. In
addition, both bathrooms have underfloor heating that is from benefit in colder winter months. The second bedroom
is equipped with 2 single beds which can be united into one big double bed. The door of the 2. bedroom has
curtains and shutters. The second bathroom has a walk-in shower, a sink, and a toilet.  The living room of our
holiday home in Samara is very carefully decorated and very well equipped to make your stay as comfortable as
possible. There is also an Apple TV in the living room and fiber optic internet in the whole holiday apartment. From
the living room and both bedrooms, you have direct access to the beautiful large terrace with an outside table. The
kitchen is fully equipped, it has a kettle, a Nespresso machine, a Toaster,  a Microwave, a Multifunctional oven, a
silent refrigerator, an induction plate, and a dishwasher. It also has all kinds of kitchenware, dishes, cutlery, glasses,
glasses of wine and champagne glasses, etc. There is also a washing machine in the kitchen. The next
supermarket is 8 min drive away ( Supersol), the beach and beach restaurants are available within 7 min drive,
Puerto Banus is a 15 min drive and marbella city center ca. 10 min. drive. The airport of Malaga is 40 min. away. 

Особенности:

Бассейн, Кондиционирование, Вид на море, Вид на горы, Лифт, Частный сад, Круглосуточная охрана,
Парковочные места, Гольф


